METROPOLITAN UTILITIES DISTRICT
Omaha, Nebraska

COMMODITY Various Projects Opened at 2:00 P.M. on January 10, 2012
’ BIDDERS
ITEMS
Project Install Water Mains in Kennedy Town Center, Repiat 3, 19th Cir. & Chandier Rd. 100055000880 100065001001
Bid Price $56,051.00 B $61,535.00
Sales Tax $0.00 -~ $0.00 .
otal Bid Price $56,051.00 NO BID $61,535.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ption1, 2,3 2 2
Bid Bond Yes Yes
Addendum 1 Yes Yes
Project Install Water Mains in Siena Francis Housing, 18th & Paul Sts. 100055000990
Bid Price $36,375.00 $47,618.00 :
Sales Tax $0.00 $0.00
Total Bid Price $36,375.00 NO BID $47,618.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Option 1, 2,3 2 2 . '
Bid Bond Yes Yes
Install Water Mains for Army Reserve Training Center; 168th St., from Rachel Snowden Parkway to Military Rd.; Military Rd. & Rainwood Rd.,
Project from 168th St. to 204th St. WP 1113 100057000240 100057000320 100057000321 100075001451 )
Bid Price $1,178,996.40 | $1,507,229.00 | $1,243,932.39 | $2,374,524.00 | $1,752,647.32 | $1,351,847.37 | $1,239,328.00
Sales Tax $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total Bid Price $1,178,996.40 $1,507,229.00 | $1,243,932.39 | $2,374,524.00 | $1,752,647.32 | $1,351,847.37 | $1,239,328.00
Option 1, 2, 3 2 3 2 2 2 2 2 '
Bid Bond Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Addendums 1 & 2 Yes 1 &2 Yes 1 &2 Yes 1 &2 Yes 1 &2 Yes 1 Yes 1 &2 Yes 1 &2






